Stone

Bituminous Concrete & Crushed

July 7, 2016@ 11:45 a.m.

Lorusso-Bristol Stone Corp.
611 Pleasant Street
Weymouth, MA 02188

Lorusso Corp.
3 Belcher St.
Plainville, MA 02762

M. Susi HMA LLC
36 Westwood Street
Dorchester, MA 02121

ACCEPT BY 7/7/2016 71712016 71712016
SIGNED Yes Yes Yes
ITEM# Class Types
1 | | (Base)
Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ No Bid | § 7248 | § 66.00
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § No Bid | § 60.00 | $ 56.50
2 | 1 (Top)
Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ No Bid | $ 7248 | $ 67.00
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § No Bid | $ 60.00 | $ 57.50
3 All Weather All Weather Patch
Patch Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ No Bid NoBid | $ 99.00
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § No Bid NoBid | $ 89.00
4 | Hot Winter Mix (Base)
Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ NoBid | § 10415 | $ 104.00
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § No Bid | $ 90.00 | $ 89.00
5 | Hot Winter Mix (Top)
Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ No Bid | $ 104.15 | § 104.00
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant $ No Bid | $ 90.00 | § 89.00
6 | QPR
Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ No Bid | $ 116.80 No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant $ NoBid | $ 112.00 No Bid
Crushed Stone
ltem # Size
7 2" Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ $ 14.55 No Bid No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § b 10.95 No Bid No Bid
8 1.5" Net Price/Ton Delivered to City § $ 1455 | $ 17.60 No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant $ $ 10951 % 11.15 No Bid
9 1" Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ 3 15.35 No Bid No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant $ 3 11.756 No Bid No Bid
10 3/4" Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ $ 15.35 | & 17.40 No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § $ 11751 % 10.95 No Bid
11 172" Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ $ 15.60 | $ 18.30 No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant $ 3 12001 % 12.80 No Bid
12 3/8" Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ $ 16.35 | § 19.30 No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § $ 12751 % 13.80 No Bid
13 Masonry Sand Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ $ 2210 % 24.00 No Bid
Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § $ 18.50 | § 20.00 No Bid
14 Dense Graded Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ $ 13.10 | § 14.95 No Bid
Crushed Stone Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant § $ 950 | % 9.00|8% 20.95
For Sub-Base
15 Reprocessed Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ $ 11.35 No Bid No Bid
Urban Stone Net Price/Ton Pick Up at Plant $ $ 7.75 No Bid No Bid
16 Minimum Delivery |Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ 33 Tons Full Trailers 24 tons
Amount
17 Premium for Deliveries |Net Price/Ton Delivered to City $ 9-19 tons $95.00 del. Chg $230. per load $240. per load

Under the Minimum

20-24 tons $4.70 p/t del. Chg.

SEE BID

SEE BID




